ENGINEERING. PLANNING & ZONING DEPT
ROGER

RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, It is the desire of the County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia to protect the life and property of the citizens of Jefferson County; and

WHEREAS, The County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia duly
passed an Ordinance adopting the State of West Virginia building code on March 29,
2001; and

WHEREAS, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia desires
that all building permits issued before April 30, 2019, shall remain valid and regulated
under the state building codes adopted and in effect prior to April 30, 2019; and

WHEREAS, The State of West Virginia has decreed that as of April 30, 2019, the
State of West Virginia building code shall be revised to the following codes with local
amendment as permitted by law:

2015 International Building Code (with exceptions/amendments).
2015 International Plumbing Code

2015 International Mechanical Code

2015 International Fuel Gas Code (with exception/amendment).

2015 International Property Maintenance Code (at the option of Jefferson
County, this ordinance is not adopted)

2009 International Energy Conservation Code for Residential Buildings
2007 ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA Standard 90.1 — for Commercial Buildings

2015 International Residential Code for One & Two Family Dwellings (with
exceptions/amendments)

2009 ICC/ANSI A117.1 American National Standards for Accessibility & Usable
Buildings and Facilities

2015 International Existing Building Code
(with amendment adopting the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code 2015 Edition)

2014 Edition of the National Electric Code, NFPA 70 Jeffersmn County
Jacqueline C Shadies Clerk

ment 201300003852
2015 International Swimming Pool and Spa Code; and ég%gt'}ggﬁ @O%}Fx:io:hiiﬂdf‘ﬁ
ORDINANCE
Hook 1221 @ Page 1

Resolution aaae Rarnedard 07
Building Code Enforcement Ordinance Pases Recorded 23

1



WHEREAS, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia desires
that all building permits issued on or after April 30, 2019, be regulated under the revised

State building code, as adopted by the County Commission of Jefferson County, West
Virginia.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the County Commission of Jefferson County,

West Virginia desires to adopt the revised State of West Virginia building code that shall

become effective April 30, 2019, and HEREBY adopts the new Building Code
Enforcement Ordinance, as attached.

BY:‘/G Q‘ZZ “;"% MQ DATE: April 4, 2019
Patsy Noland, President ;

County Commission of Jefferson County

ATTEST:

\l“‘"""""'

C 0 M M/"' ”,
: f&#ﬁ%ﬁﬁﬁ ‘fs‘éz‘ N

g
\\‘\

<>\

ﬁ

\
g

v

Resolution
Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
2



ORDINANCE AND ORDER

An ordinance and order to ADOPT the State of West Virginia building code
relating to building construction and building inspection activities in Jefferson County,
West Virginia, and enforcement of said codes.

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the County Commission of Jefferson County, West
Virginia to adopt the state building code relating to minimum building and housing
construction standards for the public safety, health, and well-being; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this code is to facilitate proper permitting, inspection,
and enforcement activities relating to the construction of buildings, structures, and
additions within the jurisdiction of Jefferson County, West Virginia.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ORDERED BY The County
Commission of Jefferson County, by authority of the Code of West Virginia under
Section 3n, Article 1, Chapter 7, of the Code of West Virginia, One-thousand Nine-
hundred Thirty-one, that the State Building Code as provided for in Section 5b, Article 3,
Chapter 29, of the Code of West Virginia, One-thousand Nine-hundred Thirty-one, are
hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the
amendments/additions/insertions/changes/exceptions, if any, prescribed in the
Jefferson County Building Code Enforcement Ordinance.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED AND ORDERED that this Ordinance and Order
shall take effect and be in force from the 30" Day of April, 2019, the public welfare
requiring it.

PASSED AND APPROVED BY The County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia on the 4th day of April, 2019.

BY:

Patsy Noland, President

County Commission of Jefferson Ceunty

ATTEST:

. Shadle
JEFFERSON COUNTY

Ordinance & Order
2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
1



JEFFERSON COUNTY
BUILDING CODE ENFORCEMENT ORDINANCE

GENERAL AUTHORITY

By authority of the Code of West Virginia, Chapter 7, Article 1, Section 3n &
Chapter 29, Article 3, Section 5b, to enforce minimum regulations governing the design,
construction, alteration, enlargement, repair, demolition, removal, and use of all
buildings and structures: providing for the issuance of permits, collection of fees, making
of inspections, providing penalties for the violation thereof, to be known as the
“Jefferson County Building Code Enforcement Ordinance”.

STANDARDS & CODES

In accordance with the provisions of the Code of West Virginia, Chapter 29,
Article 3, Section 5b, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia does
hereby adopt the State Building Code as set forth in Title 87, Legislative Rules, State
Fire Commission, Series 4, State Building Code, which becomes effective on August 1,
2016. The standards and requirements as set out and published by the International
Code Council (ICC) and the American National Standards Institute (ANSI), as listed
below, shall have the same force and effect as if set out verbatim in this Section, except
as modified and/or amended herein; any reference to the ICC Electrical Code shall
mean NFPA 70, National Electrical Code 2014.

The Property Maintenance Code is not adopted and shall not be enforced.

ADMINISTRATIVE PROCESS

The administration of the building code shall be in accordance with the
Administration Chapter of the applicable building code.

AMENDMENTS, INSERTIONS, CHANGES & APPENDIX ADOPTION

Fee Schedules for all codes: “Attachment A — Schedule of Permit Fees,” shall
apply. The Schedule of Permit Fees contained in this ordinance may be
periodically amended by the County Commission of Jefferson County, as they
deem necessary.

1) International Residential Code 2015:

Section R101.1 Title, insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
1



Section R113.4 Violation Penalties, shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person,
firm or corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and
every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the
provisions of this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon
conviction of any such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be
punishable by a fine of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In
addition to the criminal penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its
option, pursue injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West
Virginia.”

Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance, shall be amended to read as
follows:

“Any person, firm, or corporation who shall continue any work in or about
the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person, firm, or
corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every
day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of
this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon conviction of any such
violation such person, firm, or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of not
less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal penalties
provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue injunctive relief in
the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

Section R202 Definitions, [RB] Dwelling — add the following:

“Structures that can be registered as Travel Trailers (Class R)
with the West Virginia Department of Motor Vehicles shall not
be considered as “dwellings”. Occupation that exceeds 180
days per year will be will be considered “living” and the structure
shall meet building code requirements in order to remain on site
as a habitable structure. This amendment does not include
storage of unoccupied Travel Trailers.

Table R301.2 (1) insert the following design criteria:

Ground Wind Seismic Subject to Damage From Winter Ice Flood Air Mean
Snow Design Design Shield Hazard Freezi Annual
Load Category Temp Under- ng Temp.

(Deg. F) layment Index (Deg. F)
Reqd.

(lbs Speed Weathering Frost Line Termite Decay

per (mph) Depth
sq. ft.) (24"

30 90 B s nches o Heavyto | Slightto 10 N To60. 5 1000 | 526

evere bottom of Moderate | Moderate N 'clafj .
footing amende

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
2




IRC Section P2603.5.1 Sewer Depth, insert “28 (twenty eight) (710 mm)”
where “[Number]” appears.

IRC Section G2415.12 Minimum Burial Depth, delete and replace with:
“Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches
(305mm) below grade. If the minimum depth cannot be maintained, the piping
system shall be installed in conduit or shielded in an approved manner”.

IRC Section R311.7.5 Stair Treads and Risers:

Section R311.7.5.1 Riser — The maximum riser height shall be eight and
one-quarter (8-1/4) inches.

Section R311.7.4.2 Treads — The minimum tread depth shall be nine (9)
inches.

IRC Section R403.1.7.1 Building Clearances From Ascending Slopes,
delete in its entirety, no replacement.

IRC Section R403.1.7.2 Footing Setbacks From Descending Slope
Surfaces, delete in its entirety, no replacement.

IRC Section N1101-N1104 (Chapter 11) Enerqy Efficiency, delete in its
entirety, replace with 2009 International Energy Code, Chapter 4 - Residential
Energy Efficiency.

Fire Protection of Floors in Residential Buildings —
5.1 New One and Two Family Dwellings over one level in height. New One

and Two Family Dwellings containing a basement, and One and Two Family
Dwellings containing a crawl space containing a fuel burning appliance below
the first floor, shall provide a method of fire protection of floors (1) A ¥z inch
(12.7mm) gypsum wall board membrane, 5/8 inch (16 mm) wood structural
panel or equivalent on the underside of the floor framing member; (2) Wood
floor assemblies using dimensional lumber or structural composite lumber
equal or greater than 2 inch by 10 inch (50.8 mm by 254mm) nominal
dimension, or other approved floor assemblies demonstrating equivalent fire
performance: or (3) An Automatic Fire Sprinkler System as set forth in section
R313.1 or R313.2 of the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for
One and Two Family Dwellings: Provided, That floor assemblies located
directly over a space protected by an automatic sprinkler system as set forth
in section R313.2 of the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for
One and Two Family Dwellings are exempt from this requirement.

5.2 Townhouses meeting the Fire Resistant Construction Standard R302.2

will be treated as New One and Two Dwellings and shall comply with section
5.1 above

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
3



IRC Section R507 Exterior Decks, in addition to complying with this section,
decks shall also comply with the most recent edition of the American Wood
Council's Design for Code Acceptance 6 — Prescriptive Residential Deck
Construction Guide.

Note: DCA 6 will be available for review in the engineering office or obtain
a copy at the following web address:

www.awc.org/codes-standards/publications/dca6

International Residential Code 2015 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:

Appendix A —  Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping.

Appendix B -  Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped
With Draft Hoods, Category | Appliances, And Appliances
Listed For Use With Type B Vents.

Appendix C -  Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct-Vent Venting
Systems.

Appendix E -  Manufactured Housing Used As Dwellings.
Appendix F -  Radon Control Methods.

Appendix G -  Piping Standards for Various Applications
Appendix H-  Patio Covers

Appendix J - Existing Buildings and Structures.
Appendix M- Home Day Care — R3 Occupancy.
Appendix R - Light Straw-Clay Construction

Appendix S -  Strawbale Construction

2) International Building Code 2015:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 101.4.5 Fire Prevention is deleted.

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
4



Section 113.3 Board of Appeals is deleted and replaced with the following:

113.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of five members,
with up to three alternates, who are qualified by experience and training to
pass on matters pertaining to building construction and are not employees of
the jurisdiction. They may include, but are not limited to, a WV Registered
Professional Architect, or Engineer, or a WV Licensed General Building,
Residential, Electrical, Piping, Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire Protection
Contractor, with at least 10 years experience, five of which shall be in
responsible charge of work.”

Section 114.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person,
firm or corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and
every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the
provisions of this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon
conviction of any such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be
punishable by a fine of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In
addition to the criminal penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its
option, pursue injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West
Virginia.”

Section 115.3 Unlawful Continuance shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm, or corporation who shall continue any work in or about
the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person, firm, or
corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every
day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of
this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon conviction of any such
violation such person, firm, or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of not
less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal penalties
provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue injunctive relief in
the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia”

Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Loads add the following sentence at the end
of the paragraph:

“The ground snow load for Jefferson County, West Virginia shall be a
minimum of 30 pounds per square foot.”

Section 1612.3 Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas insert “Jefferson
County, West Virginia” where “[INAME OF JURISDICTION]” appears. Insert
“2009” where “[INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE]” appears in the first
paragraph.

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
5



Section 1809.5 Frost Protection, method no. 1, extending below the frost
line of the locality shall mean the depth to the bottom of the footing is a
minimum of thirty (30) inches.

Chapter 34 is deleted and replaced by the International Existing Building
Code (IEBC))

International Building Code 2015 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:
Appendix E -  Supplementary Accessibility Requirements
Appendix H -  Signs

Appendix | - Patio Covers

3) International Plumbing Code 2015:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTIONJ” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “‘[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]" appears.

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of
not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia”.

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
6



Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fifty (60)” for the not less than
‘“[AMOUNTY]" and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “/AMOUNT]".

Section 305.4.1 Sewer Depth insert “28 (twenty eight) (710mm)” where
“‘INUMBERY]” appears twice in the first paragraph.

International Plumbing Code 2015 — Appendix Adoption:
The following appendices are specifically adopted:

Appendix B-  Tables for Pressure Distribution

4) International Mechanical Code 2015:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[INAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 106.5.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “‘[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]" appears.

Section 106.5.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3
where “‘[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]” appears.

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of
not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia”.

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fifty (50)” for the not less than
‘l/AMOUNTY]" and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “[AMOUNT]".

International Mechanical Code 2015 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:

Appendix A—  Chimney ConnectorPass -Through

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
7



5) International Fuel Gas Code 2015:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[INAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]” appears.

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of
not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fifty (50)” for the not less than
“[AMOUNT]" and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “[AMOUNT]".

International Fuel Gas Code 2015 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:
Appendix A —  Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping (IFGS)

Appendix B -  Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped
With Draft Hoods, Category | Appliances, And Appliances
Listed For Use With Type B Vents (IFGS)

Appendix C -  Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct-Vent Venting
Systems (IFGS)

6) International Energy Conservation Code 2009:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
8




7) Existing Buildings Code 2015:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[INAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 101.4.2 Buildings previously occupied, omit reference to
“International Fire Code” and substitute “NFPA Life Safety Code 2009
Edition.”

Section 113.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of
not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

8) NFPA 70, National Electric Code, 2014 Edition: (no amendments).

Electrical inspections shall be conducted by an approved private (third-party)
electrical inspector, using the National Electric Code approved by the West
Virginia State Fire Commission. Fees for said electrical inspections shall be
paid by the applicant directly to the private inspector or inspection service
provider and shall not be included in the permit fees paid to the County.

9) 2009 ICC/ANSI A117.1 Standards for Accessibility and Useable Buildings and

Facilities: (no amendments).

EXCEPTIONS:

A)

The following structures are not subject to inspection by local jurisdictions:

Group U utility structures and storage sheds comprising an area not
more than 200 sq.-ft. which have no plumbing or electrical connections
and are used only for residential storage purposes. (Examples include
sheds that are for the residential storage of lawnmowers, tools, bicycles or

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
9



furniture). Not included are those utility structures and storage sheds
which have plumbing or electrical connections, are a non-residential use,
or for the storage of explosives or other hazardous or explosive materials.

B) The intent and requirements for an appeals board in each of the
separate codes may be met with the creation of a single appeals board for
the entire State Building Code, in accordance with and as amended in this
ordinance under the International Building Code 2015

2019 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
10



Attachment A

Jefferson County, West Virginia
Office of Building Permits & Inspections

116 East Washington Street
Charles Town, WV 25414
304-725-2998

Schedule of Residential Building Permit Fees (IRC)

Effective July 1, 2018
Fee Amount
Residential Permit Type Base Fee plus Fee per plus Fee per
Sq.-Ft. of Sq.-Ft. of
Finished Area Un-finished Area*
Single-Family Dwelling $95.00 $0.20 $0.20
Mobile/Manufactured Home $95.00 $0.20 $0.20
Townhouse & Duplex (less than 4 story) $95 per unit $0.20 $0.20
Residential Dwelling Addition $100.00 $0.20 $0.20

* Attached Garages, Porches & Unfinished Basements are considered Unfinished Area

Residential Interior Room/Basement Renovation

$100 + $65 per required inspection

Chimney/Fireplace (added to existing dwelling)

$150 per chimney

Sheds/Garage/Structure ancillary to Residence $75.00 $0.20 I $0.20

Decks & Above Ground Pool/Hot Tub Platforms $75.00 plus $0.20/sq.-ft. of deck area

Swimming Pool $75.00 plus $0.20/sq.-ft. of pool area and patio area.
Replacement Windows $150.00

Electrial Wiring Only $150.00

(Electric panel, new outlets, new lights, HVAC, generator, solar panels, hot tub, etc.)

Demolition - Residential Dwelling $125.00 | $0.00 [ $0.00
Retaining Wall (4' or more from footer to top wall) $75 plus $0.10/lineal foot of wall
Fence (6' or more in height above ground surface) $75 plus $0.10/lineal foot of fence
Agricultural Building $55.00 | $0.00 [ $0.00

Re-inspection Fee

$65/each re-inspection, paid prior to re-inspection

Plan change after permitissued

$65 plus $65 for each additional inspection due to plan change.

Permit Application Denied & Resubmitted within 90 days for review; $75 re-application fee

Beginning Construction Without a Permit

[ 1sttime=$75 2nd time = $150

3rd time = $300

Round Pool Fee Calculator

Round Pool Diameter (Feet) Base Fee Area of Pool (Sq-Ft) per Sq-Ft Fee Total Fee
15 $75 176.71 $0.10 $92.67
16 $75 201.06 $0.10 $95.11
17 $75 226.98 $0.10 $97.70
18 $75 254.47 $0.10 $100.45
19 $75 283.53 $0.10 $103.35
20 $75 314.16 $0.10 $106.42
24 $75 452.39 $0.10 $120.24
27 $75 572.55 $0.10 $132.26
28 $75 615.75 $0.10 $136.58
29 $75 660.52 $0.10 $141.05
30 $75 706.86 $0.10 $145.69
33 $75 855.30 $0.10 $160.53

Round Pool Fee includes the Base Fee + per Sq-Ft. Fee Amounts only. The applicant will also need to add the fee for any deck/platform

All fees are due upon submission of permit applications, plan changes, reinspections requests, etc; and are payable to:

Attachment — A
Schedule of Permit Fees




Attachment A

Jefferson County, West Virginia

Office of Building Permits & Inspections
116 East Washington Street
Charles Town, WV 25414
304-725-2998

Schedule of Commercial/Industrial Building Permit Fees (IBC)

Effective July 1,2018
Fee Amount
Commercial Permit Type Base Fee Fee per Fee per
Sq.-Ft. of Sq.-Ft. of
Finished Floor Area Un-finished Floor Area
Commercial/Industrial/Multi-Family Buildings
- - 350.00 0.25 0.2
(Less than 1,000 sq.-ft. floor area) ’ ? 30.25
Commercial/Industrial/Multi-Family Buildings
675.00 0.25 0.25

(Greater than or equal to 1,000 sq.-ft. floor area) > 5 $
Commercial Interior Room Renovation $1,000 plus $50 per required inspection
Church Building $675.00 [ $0.25 [ $0.25

Church Addition, Pavillions & Ancillary Structures

100 + $65 pe ired i cti
(Less than 1,000 sq.-ft. floor area/foot print) 3100 + 365 per required inspection

Church Addition, Pavillions & Ancillary Structures $350 $0.25 $0.25
(Greater than or equal to 1,000 sq.-ft. floor area/foot print)

Institutional (hospital, school, fire hall, etc.) $275 [ $0.18 [ $0.18
Commercial/Institutional Swimming Pool $350 per pool + $0.25/sq-ft of pool & patio; $350 per Whirlpool/Hot Tub
Demolition Permit $275.00 $0.00 $0.00
Existing Cell Tower or Electric Substation & Equipment $350.00 $0.00 $0.00
New Cell Tower or Electric Substation & Equipment $1,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
Temporary Construction/Office Trailers $75.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sign Permit: Value < or = to $2,500 $75.00 N/A N/A
Sign Permit: Value > $2,500 $350.00 N/A N/A
Retaining Wall (4' or more from footer to top wall) $75 plus $0.10/lineal foot of wall

Fence (6' or more in height above ground surface) $75 plus $0.10/lineal foot of fence
Replacement Windows $150.00 |

Electrial Wiring Only $150.00

(New electric panel & electric panel upgrades, new outlets, new lights, HVAC, generators, solar panels, hot tub electrial, etc.)

Site Plan with no Strﬁctures (parking lot, walkway, etc.) | $350.00 |plus $1.25 for every $1,000 value > $50,000
Re-inspection Fee $65/each re-inspection, paid prior to re-inspection

Plan change after permit application reviewed $65 plus $65 for each additional inspection due to plan change.
Permit Application Denied & Resubmitted within 90 days for review; $100 re-application fee.

Beginning Construction Without a Permit | (1st time = $75, 2nd time $150, 3rd time $300) + permit fee

All fees are due upon submission of permit applications, plan changes, reinspections requests, etc; and are payable to:

Attachment -A
Schedule of Permit Fees



87CSR4

ATTACHMENT - B

Legislative Rule, Title 87, Series 4, State Building Code

Effective April 30, 2019



87CSR4

WEST VIRGINIA SECRETARY OF STATE ‘eFILED
MAC WARNER 2/22/2019 2:52:51 PM
Office of West Virginia
ADMINISTRATIVE LAW DIVISION Secretary Of State

NOTICE OF FINAL FILING AND ADOPTION OF A LEGISLATIVE RULE AUTHORIZED
BY THE WEST VIRGINIA LEGISLATURE
AGENCY: Fire Commission TITLE-SERIES: 87-04
RULETYPE:  Legislative Amendment to Existing Rule: ~ Yes Repeal of existing rule: ~ No

RULE NAME: State Building Code

CITE STATUTORY AUTHORITY: ~ W.Va. Code 29-3-5b

The above rule has been authorized by the West Virginia Legislature.

Authorization is cited in (house or senate bill SB 177
number)
Section 64-6-1 Passed On 1/31/2019 12:00:00 AM

This rule is filed with the Secretary of State. This rule becomes effective on the following date:
ri 19
This rule shall terminate and have no further force or effect from the following date:

April 30, 2024

BY CHOOSING 'YES', | ATTEST THAT THE PREVIOUS STATEMENT IS TRUE AND CORRECT.

Yes
Stacy L Nowicki-Eldridge — By my signature, | certify that | am the person authorized to file
legislative rules, in accordance with West Virginia Code §29A-3-11 and §39A-3-2.

TITLE 87
2



87CSR4
LEGISLATIVE RULE

STATE FIRE COMMISSION
SERIES 4
STATE BUILDING CODE
§87-4-1. General.

1.1. Scope. -- This rule establishes the standards considered necessary by the State Fire
Commission for the safeguarding oflife and property and to ensure compliance with the minimum
standards of safe construction ofall structures erected or renovated throughout this state.

1.2. Authority. --W. Va. Code §29-3-5b.

1.3. FilingDate. -- February22,2019.

1.4. Effective Date.-- April 30,2019.

1.5. SunsetProvision. -- This rule shall terminate and have no further force or effect on April
30, 2024.

1.6. Incorporation of Other Documents. -- This rule does not include a reprinting of all the
requirements imposed by statute or by the incorporation of various nationally recognized standards
and codes cited in Subsection 4.1 of this rule. For ascertaining these additional standards and
requirements, it is necessary to make reference to the other documents.

§87-4-2. Definitions.

2.1. "ANSI"means American National Standards Institute, 25 West 43r<I St., Fourth Floor,
New York, NY 10036.

2.2. "ASTM"means American Society of Testing and Materials.

2.3. 'Fire Commission" means the thirteen (13) appointed members of the West Virginia
State Fire Commission .

2.4. 'Fire Marshal" means the West Virginia State Fire Marshal and/or his or her designated
representatives.

2.5. "[CC" or "International" means International Code Council.

2.6. '"Localjurisdiction" means municipal, county, or other local government.



87CSR4

2.7. "NFPA" means National Fire Protection Association.

2.8. "State Building Code" means the entire contents of this rule and the referenced national
standards and codes.

2.9. "State Fire Code" means the entire contents of the State Fire Code, 87CSR1, and the
referenced standards and codes.

§87-4-3. Conflicts.

3.1. Whenever there is a conflict between the State Fire Code and the State Building Code,
the State Fire Code takes precedence.

3.2. Whenever there is a conflict between the International Plumbing Code requirements of
the State Building Code and the rules of the West Virginia State Department of Health and Human
Resources, the rules of the Department of Health and Human Resources take precedence.

3.3. Whenever there is a conflict between the State Building Code and statutory laws ofthe
State of West Virginia, the laws of the State of West Virginia take precedence.

§87-4-4. National Standards and Codes.

4.1. The standards and requirements as set out and as published by the International Code
Council, and American National Standards Institute, and the National Fire Protection Association
as listed in this subsection, have the same force and effect as if set out verbatim in this rule.

4.1.a. The 2015 edition, International Building Code, with the following exceptions:

4.1.a.1. Provided, thatthe section entitled "Fire Prevention "and identified asSection
101.4.5 is deleted and not considered to be a part of this rule.

4.1.a.2. Further provided that the entire subsection entitled "Qualifications" and
identified as Section 113.3 is deleted and replaced with the following:

"Section 113.3. Board of Appeals

113.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of five members, with up to
three alternates, who are qualified by experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to
building construction and are not employees of the jurisdiction. They may include, but are not
limited to, a WV Registered Professional Architect or Engineer, or a WV Licensed General
Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping, Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire Protection Contractor, with
at least 10 years experience, five of which shall be in responsible charge of work. No less than
one of the members of such Board of Appeals shall be a WV Registered Professional Architect or
Engineer, or a WV Licensed General Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping, Plumbing,
Mechanical or Fire Protection Contractor."



87CSR4

4.1.b. The 2015 edition of the International Plumbing Code.
4.1.c. The 2015 edition ofthe International Mechanical Code.
4.1.d. The 2015 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code, with the following exception:

4.1.d.1. Section 404.10 Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum
depth of 12 inches (305 mm) below grade. Ifthe minimum depth cannot be maintained, the
piping system shall be installed in conduit or shielded in an approved manner.

4.1.e. The 2015 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code. This code may
be rejected atthe option of the local jurisdiction.

4.1.el. Provided, that Section 110.3 Failure to Comply, shall be modified as follows:

"Unless authorized by W.Va. Code §8-12-16, or absent the express consent of the
owner, if the owner of a premises fails to comply with a demolition order within the time
prescribed, the legal counsel of the jurisdiction shall institute appropriate action in the Circuit
Court of the County in which the property is located against the owner of the premises where the
structure is or was located seeking an Order causing the structure to be demolished and removed.
Thereafter, the local jurisdiction, through an available public agency or by contract or arrangement
with private persons, shall demolish and remove the structure and the costs thereof, as well as all
fees and costs incurred in the legal action, shall be alien upon such real estate."

4.1.e.2. This code may be adopted by the local jurisdiction without requiring adoption
of the other national codes and standards listed in this rule.

4.1.f. The 2009 edition of the International Energy Conservation Code for residential
buildings.

4.1.g. The ANSI/ASHRAE/IESNA Standard 90.1 2010 edition for commercial
buildings.

4.1.h. The 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for One- and Two Family
Dwellings, with the following exceptions:

4.1.h.1. Chapter 11ofthe 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for One
and Two Family Dwellings, Seventh Printing, entitled "Energy Efficiency", is exempt from this
rule.

4.1.h.2. Section G2415.12 (404.10) Minimum Burial Depth. Underground piping
systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches (305 mm) below grade. |fthe minimum
depth cannot be maintained, the piping system shall be installed in conduit or shielded in an
approved manner.

4.1.h.2. Section R311.7.5 Stair Treads and Risers



87CSR4

4.1.h2.A. 311.7.5.1RiserHeights -- Themaximum riser height shall be eight
and one-quarter (8 14) inches.

4.1h2B. 311.7.5.2 Tread Depth -- The minimum tread depth shall be nine
(9) inches.

4.1.h.3. Section R403.1.7.1: Building Clearances From Ascending Slopes is not
applicable to this rule.

4.1.h4. Section R403.1.7.2:  Footings Setbacks From Descending Slope Surfaces is
not applicable tothisrule.

4.1i. The 2009 ICC/ANSI All7.1 American National Standards for Accessibility &
Usable Buildings & Facilities.

4.1j. The2015 International Existing Building Code, with the following exception:

4.1j.1. Omit reference to International Fire Code and substitute NFPA Life Safety
Code 2015 edition.

4.1k. The 2014 edition of the National Electric Code, NFPA 70.
4.1.1. The 2015 edition ofthe International Swimming Pool and Spa Code.

4.2. Wherever referenced in the several ICC codes adopted above, any reference to the
International Fire Code should be substituted with the NFP A Life Safety Code 2015 edition.

4.3.  Whenever a certificate of occupancy isrequired of a commercial structure greater in size
than 7,600 feet, the project documents shall be designed by an Architect licensed by the WV Board
of Architects, or a Professional Engineer licensed by the WV State Board of Regisration for
Professional Engineers.

§87-4-5. Fire Protection of Floors in Residential Buildings

5.1 New One and Two Family Dwellings over one level in height, New One and Two
Family Dwellings containing a basement, and New One and Two Family Dwellings containing a
crawl space containing a fuel burning appliance below the first floor, shall provide one of the
following methods for fire protection of floors: (1) A 1R inch (12.7 mm) gypsum wallboard
membrane, 5/8 inch (16 mm) wood structural panel membrane, or equivalent on the underside of
the floor framing member; (2) Wood floor assemblies using dimension lumber or structural
composite lumber equal or greater than 2 inch by 10 inch (50.8 mm by 254 mm) nominal
dimension, or other approved floor assemblies demonstrating equivalent fire performance; or (3)
An Automatic Fire Sprinkler System as set forth in section R313.1 or R313.2 of the 2015 edition
of the International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings: Provided, That floor
assemblies located directly over a space protected by an automatic sprinkler system as set forth in
section R313.1 or R313.2 of the 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for One and

6



87CSR4

Two Family Dwellings are exempt from this requirement.

5.2. Townhouses meeting the Fire-Resistant Construction Standard R302.2 will be treated as
New One and Two Family Dwellings and shall comply with Section 5.1 above.

§87-4-6. Exceptions.
6.1. The following structures are not subject to inspection by local jurisdictions:

6.1.a. Group U utility structures and storage sheds comprising an area not more than 200
sq. ft. which have no plumbing or electrical connections and are used only for residential storage
purposes. (Examples include sheds that are for the residential storage of lawnmowers, tools,
bicycles or furniture.) Not included are those utility structures and storage sheds which have
plumbing or electrical connections are a non-residential use or for the storage of explosives or
other hazardous or explosive materials.

§87-4-7. Adoption by Local Jurisdiction.

7.1. Each local jurisdiction adopting the State Building Code shall notify the State Fire
Commission in writing. The local jurisdiction shall send a copy of the ordinance or order to the
State Fire Marshal, West Virginia State Fire Commission, 1207 Quarrier Street, 2nd floor,
Charleston, West Virginia 25301, within thirty (30) days of adoption.

7.2. Each local jurisdiction which adopts the State Building Code is responsible for the
enforcement of the building code as provided in West Virginia Code 7-1-3n and 8-12-13.

7.3. Throughout the national codes, adopted in subsection 4.1 of this rule, there are
discretionary provisions or amendments which require further action by the adopting local
jurisdiction in order to adapt these codes to various local conditions. The appendices are not a
part of the code and must also be adopted by the local jurisdiction to be enforceable. It is therefore
the intent of this rule to further authorize each local jurisdiction to further complete, by order or
ordinance, those respective areas which are indicated to be completed by the adopting
"jurisdiction” and any of the appendices the local jurisdiction wishes to adopt.

7.4. Within the penalty sections of each of the national codes, adopted in Section 4.1 of this
rule, there is a penalty for imprisonment. The provision of imprisonment for any violation of this
rule is optional with each adopting local jurisdiction.

7.5. Each of'the national codes adopted in subsection 4.1 of this rule provides for a separate
appeals board. However, the intent and requirements for an appeal board may be met with the
creation by the local jurisdiction of a single appeals board for the entire "State Building Code."

7.6. Each local jurisdiction adopting the State Building Code shall comply with the
requirements set forth in Title 87, Series 7 "Standards for the Certification and Continuing Education
of Municipal, County, and Public-Sector Building Code Officials, Building Code Inspectors and
Plans Examiners."



87CSR4

7.7. The local jurisdiction shall submit an annual report to the State Fire Commission
indicating the number of employees in their respective code enforcement department, their job
title, whether the employee is or is not certified by the State Fire Commission in their respective
discipline, as well as a verification that the entity has adopted the current version of the State
Building Code. The municipality, county or local governmental entity, shall also report what
ICC codes are being enforced respectively.

7.8. Thisannual report shall be filed with the State Fire Commission no later than the thirtieth
day of June of each year.

7.9. All questions of interpretation and enforcement of the State Building Code are
delegated to the local jurisdiction unless expressly provided by State Code, by this Rule, or
by the incorporated codes and standards referenced in this Rule.

§87-4-8. Existing Building Codes.

8.1.  All building codes previously adopted by local jurisdictions are null and void.

Attachment -B
State Law



