AGENDA
JEFFERSON COUNTY COMMISSION
THURSDAY, JUNE 10, 2010

10:15 A.M.
QOld Charles Town Library Meeting Room
200 E. Washington Street, Charles Town, WV

CALL TO ORDER

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

APPROVAL OF PURCHASE ORDERS

APPROVAL OF ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PUBLIC COMMENT

COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR REPORTS

COUNTY COMMISSION REPORTS

PRESENTATIONS:
1. 10:30 a.m.
2. 10:45 a.m.
3. 11:00 a.m.
4, 11:15 a.m.
5. 11:30 a.m.

Barbara Miller, Director of Office Homeland Security and Emergency
Management

- Christopher Strong, National Weather Service - Award of Re-certification of
the StormReady Community Designation

Roger Goodwin, Chief County Engineer

- Building Code Enforcement Ordinance - Staff Recommendation:
Adopt new State building codes that become effective on July

1, 2010 - Discussion/Action

Jennifer S. Maghan - County Clerk’s Report

Legal Update and Report - (Stephanie Grove)

Mark Schiavone, Director of Capital Planning and Management

- Budget Revision 008: Final adjustment to the general fund budget for any
department that requires intra-department transfers of funds

Page 1 of 2




NEW BUSINESS:

G. | Legislative Issues

7. Daniel Lutz - Request for use of Library Meeting Room for a read through of the stage play
A Comic Opera War - Discussion/Action

CORRESPONDENCE:

Correspondence received from the Division of Highways concerning the Statewide Transportation
Improvement Program.

Copy of a newspaper article received from the Association of Counties concerning workers’
compensation.

ANNOUNCEMENTS:

9™ Annual Farm Day is scheduled for June 19, 2010.

Notice of Public Outreach Education Workshop regarding the proposed text amendments to the
Subdivision Regulations on June 24™, 201.0 at 6:00 p.m. For further information, please contact

the Department of Planning and Zoning at 304-728-3228.

RECESS

At all times the County Commission reserves the right to rearrange agenda times because
of time constraints and to accommodate the Commiission schedule or the public.
Page 2 of 2




Minutes
Jefferson County Commission

Thursday, June 3, 2010

A meeting of the Jefferson County Commission was held on Thursday, June 3, 2010 at the Old Charles
Town Library meeting room located at 200 E. Washington Street, Charles Town, WV 25414. Present
were Lyn Widmyer, President, Commissioners Patsy Noland, Frances Morgan, Jim Surkamp and Dale
Manuel, Tim Boyde, County Administrator and Debbie Stellato.

The Meeting was called to order at 9:30 a. m. by Commissioner Widmyer.

1.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE. Following the Pledge of Allegiance, Commissioners, staff and
public attendees observed a moment of silence for long-time Ranson City Councilman Howard
Shade who passed away on Wednesday, June 2, 2010,

SUGGESTION BY MS. MORGAN to amend the previously revised wording for the Minutes of
May 20, 2010, so revised in ltem No. 2 of the May 27, 2010 minutes, to read: “Beginning at 1:30
p.m. the Commission, with non-profit and governmental organizations providing social services to
Jefferson County citizens, participated in a roundtable discussion organized by Community
Alternatives to Violence.”

Ms. Widmyer called for a vote and the May 20, 2010 and May 27, 2010 minutes were
unanimously approved as amended.

MOTION BY MR. MANUEL to approve Purchase Orders in the amount of $93,554.96, being
purchase order numbers: 48280, 48610, 48425, 48428, 48430, 48432, 48193, 48103, 48375,
48426, 48427, 48429, 48431, 48434, 48270, 48271, 48272, 48273, 48274, 48433, 48554, 47798,
47800, 48585, and 48586. Motion seconded by Ms. Morgan and unanimously approved.

MOTION BY MS. MORGAN to approve the accounts payable in the amount of $52,226.83.
Motion seconded by Mr, Manuel and unanimously approved.

PUBLIC COMMENT:

MS. WIDMYER MADE REFERENCE to a letter received by the County Commission from John
Allen, Jr., Chairman of the Jefferson County Historic Landmarks Commission thanking the
Maintenance Department, specifically Bill Polk, for organizing and supervising the community
service day at Poor House Farm on Saturday, May 15, 2010. Ms. Widmyer recommended that
staff send a copy of the letter to Mr. Polk at the Maintenance Department and that it be posted for
all maintenance staff to read.



10.

11.

12.

13,

Ms. Widmyer suggested that June 23, 2010 would be a convenient date to schedule a round table
discussion regarding impact fees and all Commissioners were in agreement. MARK
SCHIAVONE, DIRECTOR OF CAPITAL PLANNING AND MANAGEMENT is preparing a
power point presentation for the meeting.

MR. BOYDE advised the Commission ROGER GOODWIN, CHIEF COUNTY ENGINEER,
would be discussing building codes at the next County Commission meeting.

Mr. Boyde reported that there would be no legal update at this meeting as the Assistant Prosecutors
are away at a legal conference.

Mr, Boyde reported on some slight water damage to the Circuit Clerk’s Office. He stated that
people would be brought in to dry the ceiling and that part of the ceiling will have to be replaced.
Mr. Boyde further advised that the County will be filing a claim for incurred expenses with the
vendor who worked on the ceiling previously as this problem has occurred before.

MS. MORGAN REPORTED on the Stop PATH Intervener Meeting that she attended.

MR. SURKAMP COMMENTED that the County might have a court decision regarding PATH
that would help the Stop PATH group with their endeavor.

REMINDER FROM MS. NOLAND to attend the event at Applebee’s today, June 3, 2010, from
11:00 a.m. to 12:00 a.m. to benefit the Animal Welfare Society of Jefferson County.

MS. WIDMYER REPORTED that although she did not attend the Solid Waste Authority meeting,
she watched a video which depicted what happens to the solid waste when it passes into Maryland
from West Virginia.

MS. NOLAND REPORTED on Senate Bill 232 regarding Delinquent Land Sales.
MR. SURKAMP commented on broadband development.

MOTION BY MS. MORGAN to deny Dr. Ronald Flora’s request for the use of the library
meeting room for Stop Smoking Seminars and to send a letter to Dr. Flora denying his request and
citing the language in the “County Meeting Room Policy” with regard to business organizations.
Motion seconded by Ms. Noland and unanimously approved.

The Commission took a break at 9:55 a.m.
The Commission reconvened at 10:03 a.m.

KIRK DAVIS, CAPITAL PROJECTS MANAGER, presented a proposed Supplemental
Agreement between The West Virginia Department of Transportation and the County Commission
of Jefferson County, requesting that funds earmarked for the purchase of the Faraway Farm
property for future development be used instead to acquire the Old Cement Mill property for the



14.

15.

16.

17.

development of a battlefield park. Discussion followed regarding the intention of the Parks &
Recreation Board.

MOTION BY MR, MANUEL to table until paperwork is received from the Parks & Recreation
Board stating their decision regarding the Old Cement Mill property. Motion seconded by Ms.
Noland. Motion failed 3 — 2. Ms. Morgan and Mr. Surkamp voted no.

TONI MILBOURNE and BOBBY SHIRLEY OF THE PARKS AND RECREATION BOARD
presented themselves before the Commission and stated that the Old Cement Mill property is not a
“doable™ property for the Board.

MOTION BY MS. MORGAN to place this matter in the hands of Kirk Davis, assisted by Tim
Boyde, as necessary, to coordinate and schedule a round table work session with all stakeholders,
including the Parks Commission, Historic Landmarks Commission and Shepherdstown Battlefield
Preservation Association and prepare an agenda for planning purposes. Motion seconded by Ms.
Widmyer and approved 4 — 1. Ms. Noland voted no.

JEFFREY POLCZYNSKI, DIRECTOR OF COMMUNICATIONS requested the Commission
approve a contract in the amount of $9,500.00 between the Jefferson County Commission,
Emergency Communications and Global Data Consultants for IT services.

MOTION BY MR. SURKAMP to commit to the amount of $9,500.00 and approve the contract
between the Jefferson County Commission, Emergency Communications and Global Data
Consultants for IT services. Motion seconded by Ms. Widmyer and unanimously approved.

JOHN MAXEY, JEFFERSON COUNTY PLANNING COMMISSION PRESIDENT, requested
that the Commission make a decision as to whether the Planning Commission should expend
$1,000.00 to go forward with an appeal in the Far Away Farms Subdivision lawsuit, or if it should
abstain from future legal action.

MOTION BY MS. NOLAND that the$1,000.00 not be expended to appeal the decision of the
Federal Court. Motion seconded by Mr. Manuel and approved 3 — 1. Mr. Surkamp voted no and
Ms. Morgan abstained.

The Commission took a break at 11:40 a.m.

The Commission reconvened at 11:49 a.m.

JENNIFER MAGHAN, JEFFERSON COUNTY CLERK, requested the Commission to approve a
bond as follows:
“RESOLVED that Jefferson Security Bank does execute and deliver to the County
Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia, a bond in the penal sum of Seven
Hundred and Fifty Thousand Dollars ($750,000.00) as depository of public moneys
pursuant to the provisions of Chapter 18, Article 9, Section 6, of the West Virginia Code,



and that said bond be secured by deposit with First Tennessee Bank of Memphis,
Tennessee the following security:

Type Pledged Par Value Cusip
GNMA REMIC Ser 5 PF $750,000.00 38374FCZ5
Total Pledged $750,000.007

MOTION BY MR. MANUEL to approve the Jefferson Security Bank bond in the amount of
$750,000.00. Motion seconded by Ms. Morgan and unanimously approved.

18. SALLY GRAN OF THE FINANCE DEPARTMENT reported on the journal entries for the FY 10
Financial Statement and requested approval of same.

MOTION BY MS. MORGAN to approve the entries as presented by Ms. Gran in her packet.
Motion seconded by Mr, Surkamp and unanimously approved.

The Commission adjourned for lunch at 12:10 p.m.
The Commission reconvened at 1:30 p.m.

19. SENATORS JOHN UNGER AND HERB SNYDER, DELEGATE TERRY WALKER AND THE
COMMISSIONERS engaged in a roundtable discussion of pending legislative issues. Senator
Unger suggested it would be beneficial to have these discussions on a more regular basis. The
Commissioners agreed.

Ms. Morgan and Mr. Boyde left the meeting at 2:40 p.m.

MS. WIDMYER ADJOURNED the meeting at 3:20 p.m.

Upon rising the Commission recessed until Thursday morning next beginning at 9:30 o'clock a.m.

LYN WIDMYER, COMMISSION PRESIDENT



Page 1 of 1

Lliolo

=

Laura Kuhn

From: "Nichelle Hosby" <nhosby@jeffersoncountywv.org>
To: “Laura Kuhn" <laura@jeffarsoncountywv.org=
Sent: Wednesday, May 12, 2010 9:21 AM

Subject: FW: agenda request

From: Tim Boyde [mailto:tboyde@jeffersoncountywv.org]
Sent: Wednesday, May 12, 2010 8:30 AM

To: 'Barbara Miller'

Cc: 'Sandy McDonald'; 'Nichelle Hosby'

Subject: RE: agenda request

Barb:
Congratulations on the re-cert. we will put this one the agenda per your request.

Tim

From: Barbara Miller [mailto: bmiller@jeffersoncountywv.org]
Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2010 1:32 PM

To: Tim Boyde'

Subject: agenda request

Tim:

In speaking with Christopher Strong of the Sterling Office of the National Weather Service, he would like
to come to the County Commission meeting on June 10, 2010 to award us with recertification of the
StormReady Community designation. See attachment for further information. Please let me know if
this date is okay and the time of the appointment. Thank you!

Barbara J. Miller, CEM, CFM

Director,

Jefferson County Homeland Security and Emergency Management
28 Industrial Blvd., Suite 101

Kearneysville, WV 25430

(304) 728-3290 Phone

(304)728-3320 Fax

(304} 283-4227 Blackberry

bmiller@jeffersoncountywv.org

5/12/2010




Commission Office Use Only
Date on Agenda:

Appt Time or New Business:

AGENDA REQUEST FORM

Name: _Roger Goodwin

Department or Entity: Engineering

Estimation of amount of time needed for appointment: 15 minutes

Date Requested — 1** Choice: June 10, 2010

Date Requested — 2™ Choice:

If a specific date is needed, please provide reason for specific date:

Subject: Building Code Enforcement Ordinance

Please provide the County Commission with a description of your request or presentation, including any
background information:

Under West Virginia State Code, Title 87, Legislative Rule, State Fire Commission, Series 4, State Building
Code, the State Fire Commission established new standards for the State building code on April 26,
2010. The new standards become effective on July 1, 2010. Therefore, the Commission needs to amend
the current Building Code Enforcement Ordinance to adopt the new standards.

Recommended motion (Please type out the wording of the motion that you would like the Commission
to approve):

| move approval of the Resolution and the new Jefferson County Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
and Order adopting the new State building codes that become effective on July 1, 2010.

Attachments: Resolution to adopt the new standards
Ordinance and Order adopting the new standards



RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, It is the desire of the County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia to protect the life and property of the citizens of Jefferson County,; and

WHEREAS, The County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia duly
passed an Ordinance adopting the State of West Virginia building code on March 29,
2001; and

WHEREAS, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia desires
that all building permits issued before July 1, 2010, shall remain valid and regulated
under the state building codes adopted and in effect prior to July 1, 2010; and

WHEREAS, The State of West Virginia has decreed that as of July 1, 2010, the
State of West Virginia building code shall be revised to the following codes with local
amendment as permitted by law:

2009 International Building Code, First Printing {with exceptions/amendments).
2009 International Plumbing Code, First Printing

2009 International Mechanical Code, First Printing

2009 International Fuel Gas Code, First Printing (with exceptionfamendment).

2009 International Property Maintenance Code, First Printing (at the option of
Jefferson County, this ordinance is not adopted)

2003 International Energy Conservation Code, Fifth Printing

2009 International Residential Code for One & Two Family Dwellings, First
Printing (with exceptions/amendments)

ICC/ANSI A117.1 American National Standards for Accessibility & Usable
Buildings and Facilities/2003

2009 International Existing Building Code, First Printing
(with amendment adopting the NFPA 101, Life Safety Code 2009 Edition)

2008 Edition of the National Electric Code, NFPA 70; and
and:

WHEREAS, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia desires
that all building permits issued on or after July 1, 2010, be regulated under the revised

Resolution
Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
1



State building code, as adopted by the County Commission of Jefferson County, West
Virginia.

THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia desires to adopt the revised State of West Virginia building code that

shall become effective July 1, 2010, and HEREBY adopts the new Building Code
Enforcement Ordinance, as attached.

BY: DATE:
Lyn Widmyer, President
County Commission of Jefferson County

ATTEST:

Jennifer Maghan
CLERK OF JEFFERSON COUNTY

Resolution
Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
2



ORDINANCE AND ORDER

An ordinance and order to ADOPT the State of West Virginia building code
relating to building construction and building inspection activities in Jefferson County,
West Virginia, and enforcement of said codes.

WHEREAS, it is the desire of the County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia to adopt the state building code relating to minimum building and housing
construction standards for the public safety, health, and well-being; and

WHEREAS, the adoption of this code is to facilitate proper permitting, inspection,
and enforcement activities relating to the construction of buildings, structures, and
additions within the jurisdiction of Jefferson County, West Virginia.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND ORDERED BY The County
Commission of Jefferson County, by authority of the Code of West Virginia that the
foliowing state codes Section 3n, Article 1, Chapter 7, of the Code of West Virginia,
One-thousand Nine-hundred Thirty-one and the State Building Code as provided for in
Section 5b, Article 3, Chapter 29, of the Code of West Virginia, One-thousand Nine-
hundred Thirty-one, are hereby adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set outin
this ordinance, with the amendments/additions/insertions/changes, if any, prescribed in
the Jefferson County Building Code Enforcement Ordinance.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED AND ORDERED that this Ordinance and Order
shall take effect and be in force from the 1% day of July, 2010, the public welfare
requiring it.

PASSED AND APPROVED BY The County Commission of Jefferson County,
West Virginia on the day of June, 2010.

BY:

Lyn Widmyer, President
County Commission of Jefferson County

ATTEST:

Jennifer Maghan
CLERK OF JEFFERSON COUNTY

Ordinance & Order
Building Code Enforcement Crdinance
1



JEFFERSON COUNTY
BUILDING CODE ENFORCEMENT ORDINANCE

GENERAL AUTHORITY

By authority of the Code of West Virginia, Chapter 7, Article 1, Section 3n &
Chapter 29, Article 3, Section 5b, to enforce minimum regulations governing the design,
construction, alteration, enlargement, repair, demolition, removal, and use of all
buildings and structures: providing for the issuance of permits, collection of fees,
making of inspections, providing penalties for the violation thereof, to be known as the
“Jefferson County Building Code Enforcement Ordinance”.

STANDARDS & CODES

In accordance with the provisions of the Code of West Virginia, Chapter 29,
Article 3, Section 5b, the County Commission of Jefferson County, West Virginia does
hereby adopt the State Building Code as set forth in Title 87, Legislative Rules, State
Fire Commission, Series 4, State Building Code, which becomes effective on July 1,
2010. The standards and requirements as set out and published by the International
Code Council (ICC) and the American National Standards Institute (ANSI), as listed
below, shall have the same force and effect as if set out verbatim in this Section, except
as modified and/or amended herein; any reference to the ICC Electrical Code shall
mean NFPA 70, National Electrical Code 2008. Copies of all adopted Codes and
Legislative Rules shall be on file in the Office of the Clerk of the County Commission.

The Property Maintenance Code is not adopted and shall not be enforced.

ADMINISTRATIVE PROCESS
The administration of the building code shall be in accordance with the
Administration Chapter of the applicable building code.
AMENDMENTS, INSERTIONS, CHANGES & APPENDIX ADOPTION
Fee Scheduie for all codes: “Attachment A — Schedule of Permit Fees,” shall
apply. The Schedule of Permit Fees may be amended from time to time, by the

County Commission of Jefferson County.

1) International Residential Code 2009:

Section R101.1 Title, insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where ‘[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]" appears.

2010 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
1



Section R113.4 Violation Penalties, shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of

the adopted codes shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person,

firm or corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and

every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the
provisions of this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon
conviction of any such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be

punishable by a fine of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In

addition to the criminal penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at
its option, pursue injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County,
West Virginia.”

Section R114.2 Unlawful Continuance, shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm, or corporation who shall continue any work in or about

the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person, firm, or

corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every

day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of

this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon conviction of any such
violation such person, firm, or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of not
less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal penalties
provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue injunctive relief
in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

Table R301.2(1) insert the foliowing design criteria:

Ground Wind Seismic Subject to Damage From Winter lce Flood Air Mean
Snow Design Design Shield Hazard Freez- Annual
Load Category Temp Under- ing Tamp.

(Deg. F) layment Index (Deg. F)
Reqd.
(lbs Speed Weathering Frost Line Termite Decay
per {mgph) Depth
sq. ft.) (247
Min. 30

3o

90

Severe

inches to
bottom of
foater

Heavy to
Moderate

Slight to
Maderate

10

FiR.M.
1980, as
amended

1000

IRC Section P2603.6.1 Sewer Depth, insert “28 (twenty eight) (710 mm)”

where “[Number]” appears.

IRC Section G2415.10 Minimum Burial Depth, delete and replace with:

“Underground piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches
(305mm) below grade. If the minimum depth cannot be maintained, the
piping system shall be installed in conduit or shielded in an approved
manner”.

2010 Building Code Enfercement Ordinance

2




IRC Section R303.6.1 Light Activation - The control for activation of the
required interior stairway lighting shall be accessible at the top and bottorn of
each stairway without traversing any steps. The illumination of exterior
stairways shall be controlled from inside the dwelling unit. Exceptions: 1.
Lights that are continuously illuminated or automatically controlled. 2.
Interior stairways consisting of less than three steps.

IRC Section R311.3.1 — Landings_at Doors — Where a stairway or two or
fewer risers is located on the exterior side of a door, other than the required
exit door, a landing is not required for the exterior side of the door.

IRC Section R311.7.4 Stair Treads and Risers:

Section R311.7.4.1 Riser Heights — The maximum riser height shall be
eight and one-quarter (8-1/4) inches. '

Section R311.7.4.2 Tread Depth — The minimum tread depth shali be nine
(9) inches.

IRC Section R313 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems, delete in its entirety, no
replacement.

IRC Section R403.1.7.1 Building Clearances From Ascending Slopes, delete
in its entirety, no replacement.

IRC Section R403.1.7.2 Footing Setbacks From Descending Slope Surfaces,
delete in its entirety, no replacement.

IRC Section N1101-N1104 (Chapter 11) Energy Efficiency, delete in its
entirety, no replacement.

International Residential Code 2009 — Appendix Adoption;

The following appendices are specifically adopted:
Appendix A—  Sizing And Capacities of Gas Piping.

Appendix B —  Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped
With Draft Hoods, Category | Appliances, And Appliances
Listed For Use With Type B Vents.

Appendix C -  Exit Terminals Of Mechanical Draft And Direct-Vent Venting
- Systems.

Appendix E - Manufactured Housing Used As Dwellings.

2010 Building Code Enfercement Ordinance
3



Appendix F - Radon Control Methods.
Appendix G-  Swimming Pools, Spas And Hot Tubs.
Appendix J - Existing Buildings and Structures.

Appendix M- Home Day Care — R3 Occupancy.

2) International Building Code 2009:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]" appears.

Section 101.4.5 Fire Prevention is deleted.
Section 113 Board of Appeals is deleted and replaced with the following:
"Section 113 Board of Appeals

113.3 Qualifications. The board of appeals shall consist of five
members, with up to three alternates, who are qualified by experience and
training to pass on matters pertaining to building consiruction and are not
employees of the jurisdiction. They may include, but are not limited to, a WV
Registered Professional Architect, or Engineer, or a WV Licensed General
Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping, Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire
Protection Contractor, with at least 10 years experience, five of which shall be
in responsible charge of work.”

Section 114.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person,
firm or corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and
every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the
provisions of this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon
conviction of any such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be
punishable by a fine of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In
addition to the criminal penalties provided hersin, Jefferson County may, at
its option, pursue injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County,
West Virginia.”

Section 115.3 Unlawful Continuance shall be amended to read as follows:

“Any person, firm, or corparation who shall continue any work in or about

the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such

2010 Building Coede Enforcement Grdinance
4



work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and each such person, firm, or
corporation shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every
day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of
this code is committed, continued, or permitted. Upon conviction of any such
violation such person, firm, or corporation shall be punishable by a fine of not
less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal penalties
provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue injunctive relief
in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia”

Section 1608.2 Ground Snow Loads add the following sentence at the end of
the paragraph:

“The ground snow load for Jefferson County, West Virginia shall be a
minimum of 30 pounds per square foot.”

Section 1612.3 Establishment of Flood Hazard Areas insert “Jefferson
County, West Virginia” where “[NAME OF JURISDICTIONY” appears. Insert
“1980” where "[INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE]" appears in the first
paragraph.

Section 1809.5 Frost Protection, method no. 1, extending below the frost line
of the locality shall mean the depth to the bottom of the footing is a minimum
of thirty (30) inches.

Section 3412.2 Applicability, insert “March 29, 2001” where “[DATE TO BE
TO BE INSERTED BY THE JURISDICTON]” appears in the first paragraph.

International Building Code 2009 - Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:

AppendixH-  Signs

3) International Plumbing Code 2009:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where ‘[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]" appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3
where “‘[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]" appears.

2010 Building Code Enforecement Ordinance
5



Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition fo the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia”.

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fifty (50)” for the not less than
‘[AMOUNTY and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “[AMOUNTT".

Section 305.6.1 Sewer Depth insert “28 (twenty eight) (710mm)” where
“INUMBERY]” appears twice in the first paragraph.

Section 904.1 Roof Extension insert “12 (twelve) (300mm)” where
‘INUMBERY]” appears in the first paragraph.

International Plumbing Code 2009 — Appendix Adoption:;

The following appendices are specifically adopted:
Appendix B—  Rates of Rainfall for Various Cities
Appendix D -  Degree Day and Design Temperatures

Appendix E -  Sizing of Water Piping System

4) International Mechanical Code 2008:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 106.5.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]" appears.

Section 106.5.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3

2010 Building Cede Enforcement Ordinance
B




where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]’ appears.

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a
permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its opfion, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia™.

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fiffy (50)” for the not less than
“[AMOUNTY" and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “‘[AMOUNTT".

International Mechanical Code 2009 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:

Appendix A—  Combustion Air Openings And Chimney Connector
Pass-Throughs

5) International Fuel Gas Code 2009:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]” appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 2
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGE]" appears.

Section 106.6.3 Fee Refunds insert “zero percent (0%)” in paragraph no. 3
where “[SPECIFY PERCENTAGEY appears.

Section 108.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the
approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a

permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of

2010 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
7



a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

Section 108.5 Stop Work Orders insert “fifty (50)” for the not less than
“[AMOUNTYJ" and “five-hundred (500)” for the not more than “[AMOUNT]",

international Fuel Gas Code 2009 — Appendix Adoption:

The following appendices are specifically adopted:

Appendix A —  Sizing And Capacities of Gas Piping (IFGS)

Appendix B -  Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped
With Draft Hoods, Category | Appliances, And Appliances
Listed For Use With Type B Vents (IFGS)

Appendix C -  Exit Terminals Of Mechanical Draft And Direct-Vent Venting
Systems (IFGS)

6) International Energy Conservation Code 2003:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where “[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]" appears.

7) Existing Buildings Code 2009:

Section 101.1 Title insert “Jefferson County, West Virginia” where ‘[NAME
OF JURISDICTION]® appears.

Section 101.4.2 Buildings Previously Occupied, omit reference to
“International Fire Code” and substitute “NFPA Life Safety Code 2009
Edition.”

Section 113.4 Violation Penalties shall be amended as follows:

“Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of any of
the adopted codes or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof
or who shall erect, install, alter or repair plumbing work in violation of the

approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a

2010 Building Code Enforcement Ordinance
8



permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be guilty of
a misdemeanor; and each such person, firm or corporation shall be deemed
guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof, during
which any violation of any of the provisions of this code is committed,
continued, or permitted, after notice has been served. Upon conviction of any
such violation such person, firm or corporation shall be punishable by a fine
of not less than $50.00 or more than $500.00. In addition to the criminal
penalties provided herein, Jefferson County may, at its option, pursue
injunctive relief in the Circuit Court of Jefferson County, West Virginia.”

8) NFPA 70, National Electric Code, 2008 Edition: (ho amendments).

Electrical inspections shall be conducted by an approved private (third-party)
electrical inspector, using the National Electric Code approved by the West
Virginia State Fire Commission. Fees for said electrical inspections shall be
paid by the applicant directly to the private inspector or inspection service
provider and shall not be included in the permit fees paid to the County.

9) ICC/ANSI A117.1 Standards for Accessibility and Useable Buildings and

Facilities: (no amendments).

EXCEPTIONS:

A)

B)

The following structures are not subject to inspection by local jurisdictions:

Group U utility structures and storage sheds comprising an area not more
than 150 sq.-ft. which have no plumbing or electrical connections and are
used only for residential storage purposes. (Examples include sheds that
are for the residential storage of lawnmowers, tools, bicycles or furniture).
Not included are those utility structures and storage sheds which have
plumbing or electrical connections, are a non-residential use, or for the
storage of explosives or other hazardous or explosive materials.

The intent and requirements for an appeals board in each of the separate
codes may be met with the creation of a single appeals board for the
entire State Building Code, in accordance with and as amended in this
ordinance under the International Building Code 2009,

2010 Buiiding Code Enforcement Ordinance
9



Aftachment - A

Jefferson County, West Virginia
Department of Planning, Zoning & Engineering

SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES
(As of July 1, 2010)
RESIDENTIAL
Type Base Fes Additional Square Foot Fee
Single Family Residence $25 Finished $0.18  Unfinished
(Including Modular/Mobile Homes) plus $25 per deck $0.10
Additions $50 $0.18
. iy $50 plus $50 per
Internal Renovations to Existing Home required inspecption
Sheds, Decks, Detached Garages & Other $50 $0.08
Structures Ancillary to Residences )
Attached Residential Structures $25 per dwelling unit $0.20

{Duplexes & Town Homes less than 4 story) plus $25 per deck

Swimming Pocl $25

$0.08/sq.-ft. of pool surface area

AGRICULTURAL

Bona-fide Agricultural Structure {requires an affidavit)

$50.00

COMMERCIAL
Value less than $250 plus $0.18 per sq.-ft.
: . . . _— $50,000 of building floor space.
Commercial/Industrial/Multi-Family Buildings Value greater than $500 plus $0.18 per sq.-t
$50,000 of building floor space.
Signs Value $2500 or less $50.00/sign
g Value over $2500 $250.00/sign
Value less than S .
Churches, church additions, pavilions, and $25,000 $50.00 per required inspection
other ancillary structures Value$ggegt0%r than $250 plus $0.18 per sq.-ft.
Demolition Permit - Commercial $200

Site Plan - improvement Location Permit Only (No structures)

$250.00 plus $1.00 for every
$1,000 of value over $50,000

Cell Towers & Electric Substation - Site Plan ILP

$1,000.00/site

Cell Tower & Electric Substation Equipment - Building Permit $250
MISCELLANEQUS

Chimney Additions $100/chimney
Temporary Construction Trailer $50

Reinspection of any component

$50/reinspection

Permit Application Denied & resubmitted with 90 days for review.

$75.00 reapplication fee only.

Plan Change After Permit is Issued

$50 plus $50 for each required
inspection due to plan change

Note: The permit application fee for any application not specifically covered by this Fee Schedule shall be
determined at the discretion of the Director of Planning, Zoning and Engineering.

Attachment - A
Schedule of Permit Fees




ATTACHMENT - B

Legislative Rule, Title 87, Series 4, State Building Code

Effective July 1, 2010

Note: Title 87, Series 4, is available from the
Administrative Law Division of the Office of the West Virginia Secretary of State
Title 87, Series 4, may be viewed at the following link:

http://apps.sos.wv.govicsrdocs/pdfdocs/87-04.pdf

Attachment — B, Title 87, Legislative Rule, State Fire Commission, State Building Code



WEST VIRGINIA o ot Harkh T Bos

SECRETARY OF STATE ST =T
NATALIE E. TENNANT

ADMINISTRATIVE LAW DIVISION | "% Przu

HOTIGE OF RINAL FILING AHD ADOPTION OF & LEGISLATIVE RULE ALITHORIZED
BY THE WEST VIRGINIA LEGISLATURE

AGENCY: _West Virpinia Suete Fire Cumnmlision

TTFL.E NUMBER . 87

AMENDMERT 10 AN EXISTING RULE: vES . No—
IF YES, SERTRS NUMRRR [ RUT.F BEING AMENTFT, 1
TITI.F OF RULE BEING AMENDLL, St Building Code

TFHO, SFRIFS KUMBER O BULE BEING PROPOYED:

TITLE OF RULE BEIMC: FROPOSRD:

et G . T — . e n p a ——— o — —— —— — e hu

R T

LHE ABOYE RULE HAY BEEN ALTHORIZED BY THE WEST VIRGINA LLGISLAYURE.

AUTHORTZATION T8 CITEDR IN dhowse or sovate bill aunthery SJB4081
sucTioN §3-6:2

PASSI On Marci BT, riagil}

THIS RULE 1S FILED WITH THE SECRFTARY OF STATE THIS EULE BECOMES EVFECTIVE ON THE
POLIOWING RATE: duly |, 2010 '

A g | s
SN PR
ANl
i '|I I- F'\"- B
y

Authoraed Benmure

Attachment — B, Title 87, Legislative Rule, State Fire Commission, State Building Code



TITLE 87
LEGISLATIVE RULE
STATE FIRE COMMISSION
SERIES 4
STATE BUILDING CODE

§87-4-1. General,

1.1. Scope -- This rule establishes the
standards considered necessary by the State Fire
Commission for the safeguarding of life and
property and to ensure compliance with the
minimum standards of safe construction of all
structures erected or renovated throughout this
state.

1.2. Authority, -- W. Va. Code 29-3-5b.
1.3. Filing Date. -- April 26, 2010
1.4, Effective Date. - July 1,2010

1.5. Incorporation of other Documents: This
rule does not include a reprinting of all the
requirements imposed by statute or by the
incorporation of various nationally recognized
standards and codes cited in Subsection 4.1 of
this rule. For ascertaining these additional
standards and requirements, it is necessary to
make reference to the other documents.

§87-4-2. Definitions.

2.1. "ANSI" means "American National
Standards Institute, 25 West 434 8t., Fourth
Floor, New York, NY 10036.

2.2, "ASTM" means American Society of
Testing and Materials.

2.3. "Fire Commission" - means the thirteen
(13) appointed members of the West Virginia
State Fire Commission.

2.4. "Fire marshal" - means the West
Virginia State Fire Marshal and/or his or her
designated representatives.

2.5. "Local jurisdiction” - means municipal
or county level government.

2.6. "ICC" or "International”" means
"International Code Council”, 5203 Leesburg
Pike, Suite 600, Falls Church, Virginia 22041-
3401.

2.7. "NFPA" means "National Fire
Protection Association", 1 Batterymarch Park,
P. O. Box 9101, Quincy, MA 02269-9101.

2.8. "State Building Code" - means the
entire contents of this rule and the referenced
national standards and codes.

2.9, "State Fire Code" means the entire
contents of State Fire Commission, State Fire
Code, 87CSRI, and the referenced standards and
codes.

§87-4-3. Conflicts.

3.1. Whenever there is a conflict between
the State Fire Code and the State Building Code,
the State Fire Code takes precedence.

3.2. Whenever there is a conflict between
the International Plumbing Code requirements of
the State Building Code and the rules of the
West Virginia State Department of Health and
Human Resources, the rules of the Department
of Health and Human Resources take
precedence.

3.3. Whenever there is a conflict between
the State Building Code and statutory laws of
the State of West Virginia, the laws of the State
of West Virginia take precedence.

§87-4-4, National Standards and Codes.

4.1 The standards and requirements as set
out and as published by the International Code
Council, and American National Standards
Institute, and the National Fire Protection

Attachment — B, Title 87, Legislative Ruie, State Fire Cammission, State Buiiding Code



Association as listed in this subsection, have the
same force and effect as if set out verbatim in
this rule.

4.1.1. The 2009 edition, International
Building Code, First Printing, with the following
exceptions:

4,1,1.A. Provided; that the section
entitled "Fire Prevention” and identified as
Section 10104.5 is deleted and not considered to
be a part of this rule.

4.1.1.B. Further provided that the
entire section entitled "Board of Appeals" and
identified as Section 113 is deleted and replaced
with the following:

Section 113 Board of Appeals

113.3 Qualifications. The board of
appeals shall consist of five members, with up to
three alternates, who are qualified by experience
and training to pass on matters pertaining to
building construction and are not employees of
the jurisdiction. They may include, but are not
limited to, a WV Registered Professional
Architect or Engineer, or a WV Licensed
General Building, Residential, Electrical, Piping,
Plumbing, Mechanical or Fire Protection
Contractor, with at least 10 years experience,
five of which shall be in responsible charge of
work.

4.1.2. The 2009 edition of the
international Plumbing Code, First Printing.

4.1.3. The 2009 edition of the
International Mechanical Code, First Printing.

4.1.4. The 2009 edition of the
International Fuel Gas Code, First Printing, with
the following exception:

Section 404.10 Underground piping systems
shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches
(305 mm} below grade. If the minimum depth
cannot be maintained, the piping system shall be
installed in conduit or shielded in an approved
manmner.

87CSR4

4.1.5. The 2009 edition of the
International Property Maintenance Code, First
Printing. This Code may be rejected at the
option of the focal jurisdiction.

4.1.5.A. This code may be adopted
by the local jurisdiction without requiring
adoption of the other national codes and
standards listed in this section.

4.1.6. The 2003. edition of the
International Energy Conservation Code, Fifth
Printing.

4.1.7. The 2009 edition of the
International Residential Code for One and Two
Family Dwellings, First Printing, with the
following exceptions:

Section G2415.10 (404.10) Minimum Burial
Depth. Underground piping systems shall be
installed a minimum depth of 12 inches (303
mm) below grade. I the minimum depth cannot
be maintained, the piping system shall be
installed in conduit or shielded in an approved
manner.

Section R303.6.1 Light Activation - The
control for activation of the required interior
stairway lighting shall be accessible at the top
and bottom of each stairway without traversing
any steps. The illumination of exterior stairways
shall be controlled from inside the dwelling umit.
Exceptions: 1. Lights that are continuously
illuminated or automatically controlled. 2.
Interior stairways consisting of less than three
steps.

Section R 311.3.1 Landings at doors Where
a stairway of two or fewer risers is
located on the exterior side of a door, other that
the required exit door, a landing is not required
for the exterior side of the door.

Section R311.7.4 Stair Treads and Risers

311.704.1 Riser Heights - The maximum
riser height shall be eight and one-quarter (8-1/4)
inches.

311.7.4.2 Tread Depth ~ The minimum
tread depth shalf be nine (%) inches.

Astachment - B, Title 87, Legislative Rule, State Fire Commission, State Building Code



Section R313: Automatic Fire Sprinkler
Systems, in its entirety, is specifically excluded
from the scope of this rule series.

Section R403 .1.7.1; Building Clearances
From Ascending Scopes is not applicable to this
rule.

Section R403.1.7.2: Footings Setbacks From
Descending Slope Surfaces is not applicable to
this rule.

4.1.8. The 2003 ICC/ANSI A117.1 American
National Standards for Accessibility & Usable
Buildings & Facilities, First Printing,

4.1.9. The 2009 International
Existing Building Code, First Printing, with the
following exception:

4.1.9.A. Omit reference to
International Fire Code and substitute NFPA
Life Safety Code 2009 Edition.

4.1.10 The 2008 edition of the
National Electric Code, NFPA 70,

§87-4-5. Exceptions.

The following structures are not subject
to inspection by local jurisdictions:

Group U utility structures and storage

sheds comprising an area not more than 150 sq.
ft, which have no plumbing or electrical
connections and are used only for residential
storage purposes. (Examples include sheds that
are for the residential storage of lawnmowers,
tools, bicycles or furniture.) Not included are
those utility structures and storage sheds which
have plumbing or electrical connections are a
non-residential use or for the storage of
explosives or other hazardous or explosive
materials.

887-4-6. Availability of Code Books.
A copy of the codes listed in Subsection

4.1 of this rule have been filed with the
Secretary of State. These code books,

87CSR4

4.1.7.A. Chapier 11 of the 2009 edition
of the International Residential Code for
One and Two Family Dwellings,
Seventh Printing, entitled "Energy
Efficiency”, is deleted and not
considered to be a part of this rule.

collectively or separately, may be obtained by
contacting the International Code Council, 4051
West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills,
llinois 60478-5795, 1-888-422-7233, or the
ICC Store, [-800-786-4452,

§87-4-7. Adoption by Local Jurisdiction.

7.1. Each local jurisdiction adopting the
State Building Code shall notify the State Fire
Comimission in writing. The local jurisdiction
shall send a copy of the ordinance or order to the
State Fire Marshal, West Virginia State Fire
Commission, 1207 Quarrier Street, 2nd floor,
Charleston, West Virginia 25301, within thirty
{30) days of adoption.

7.2. Each local jurisdiction which adopts
the State Building Code is responsible for the
enforcement of the building code as provided in
West Virginia Code 7-1-3n and 8-12-13.

7.3. Throughout the national codes, adopted in

subsection 4.1 of this rule, there are
discretionary provisions or amendments which
require further action by the adopting local
jurisdiction in order to adapt these codes to
various local conditions. The appendices are not
a part of the code and must also be adopted by
the local jurisdiction to be enforceable. It is
therefore the intent of this rule to further
authorize each local jurisdiction to further
complete, by order or ordinance, those
respective areas which are indicated to be
completed by the adopting "jurisdiction” and
any of the appendices the local jurisdiction
wishes to adopt.

Attachment — B, Title 87, Legislative Rule, State Fire Commission, State Building Gode



87CSR4

7.4. Within the penalty sections of each of
the national codes, adopted in Section 4.1 of this
rule, there is a penalty for imprisonment. The
provision of imprisonment for any violation of
this rule is optional with each adopting local
jurisdiction.

7.5. Each of the national codes adopted in
subsection 4.1 of this rule provides for a separate
appeals board. However, the intent and
requirements for an appeal board may be met
with the creation by the local jurisdiction of a
single appeals board for the entire "State
Building Code."

§87-4-8. Existing Building Codes.
8.1. All building codes which have been
adopted by local jurisdictions prior to the

passage of West Virginia Code 29-3-5b, in 1988,
are null and void.

Attachment ~ B, Tille 87, Legislative Ruie, State Fire Commission, State Building Cede



Commission Office Use Only
Dale on Agenda:

Appt Time or New Business:

AGENDA REQUEST FORM

Name: F. Mark Schiavone

Department or Entity: DCPM

Estimation of amount of time needed for appointiment: 10 min

Date Reguested — 1% Choice: 10 June 2010

Date Requested ~ 2" Choice:

If a specific date is needed, please provide reason for specific date: This is the last Regular
Session before the SAO deadline of 15 June for any budget revisions requiring their approval.

Subject: Revision 008 to the General Fund

Please provide the County Commission with a description of your request or presentation,
including any background information: This revision is expected to be the final adjustment to
the general fund budget for any department that requires intra-department transfers of funds.

Recommended motion (Please type out the wording of the motion that you would like the
Commission te approve): Move to approve the resolution to accept budget revision 008 to the
General Fund.

Attachments: Supplementary materials to be delivered as soon as possible.




)@mf /2@524,,% Zx»](z:éf F/Z%f jz/ CM&JEZ 7
__ Wﬁdg ”’@Cﬂ’z ¥ JM&MM cvat /é;, xm i/
& ( 4/%}»?;7 &/’L@»f o /4@% 7= 2? @W@C ;J”{ﬁ

Wt B _Mcf%ffxﬁ’ﬁ/ /
7 omic FEn AR, &
Y M’Zf/‘p M‘//‘é" \m%( /g?zﬁmj A (S

o L3O P ( /8730 ﬁam) o
) __ |

— "i?wé,.?mu’/oi@ alvoucs.




STMPL!

WEST VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

Division of Highways
1900 Kanawha Boulevard East  Building Five - Room 11

Joe Manchin 1 Charleston, West Virginia 25305-0430 « (304) 558-3505
Governor

JUN &1 2010

May 28, 2010 7
Jetferson County Commission

To Whom it May Concern:

The Statewide Transportation Improvement Program (STIP) is a financially constrained
document required to show planned Federal Highway Administration (FHWA) and Federal Transit
Administration (FTA) expenditures for federal fiscal years 2010-2015. One of the requirements (o
funding any projects with FHWA or FTA funds is that each proposed project undergo a public “review
and comment period”. Therefore, additions or deletions to the STIP and certain changes to projects
currently in the STIP must meet this requirement before federal funds can be obtained. Accordingly, I
am again requesting your assistance in making available (to anyone who wishes to review them) the
attached listing of proposed amendments to the approved 2010-2015 STIP.

All written comrments are to be received no later than June 11, 2010, and should be addressed
to:

Mr. Robert L. Pennington, Director

Program Planning and Administration Division
West Virginia Division of Highways

Building 5, Room A-816

1900 Kanawha Boulevard, East

Charleston, West Virginia 25305-0430

Should you need additional information, please call (304) 558-3113. Thank you for vour
assistance in this matter; your efforts are indeed appreciated.

Very truly yours, N

[ggRObrt L. Pennington, Director
Program Planning and Administration Division

RLP:Ch

Attachment

ce: Mr. Tony Tarone, Federal Transit Administration — w/ attachment
Mr. Jeff Blanten, Federal Highway Administration — w/ attachment

Mr. Kevin Burgess, Federal Highway Administration — w/ attachment
Ms. Susan O*Connell, Division of Public Transit — w/ attachment

E.E.OJAFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER




¢ 10 | abeg 0L0Z/9Z/S  91EQ Ulid # LNSNANIINY

123rodd M3N aay - 5 v
‘o0e" 00L'1$ | m W ! _ o]
oo0'oeg’LS 060'00L' LS : 00 000 Z261Z 0ZEX - QVOY SS90V 318 LSNOD| SSTDOV Selvd NDISNCOD m ..SON_m mm.ﬁo_‘oms.mm.a_. w o HHIDZ | wHAYNY
123r0ud M3N ady - & aiNY
| . : . _ o]
000'0¥¥$ , 000°085% 00 000 ZEBLZ OZEX OVOK 85300V 7 HE 1SNOD| SSI09Y MHd NHISNOOD)] wzm_ HH,0102/8¢/L w OL0Z | wHAMVNY
J1YAIGNYD ALIHMOHLINY NOILYDITEO 390149 I¥NOQILIGAY - LOArodd MaN ady - 5 GiNY
[ . .W v o H
W 000'00%$ i 000°'005% QL009:06%8 |00 100 09106 0ZES (995 goXeL ) 1dT W8 (O AN HovE] YHOSNTH) NOD J¥0|0102/82/9 w 010Z | VHAMYNW
1903rodd AMaN agy - & ayY
i ; E B B . o
oo0'ees | conors | omouven | 002k 160 0785 | )i mvdans oo Daly 450 o veoll N3 WI0L0Z/82/9 || |0b0Z | i
1D3rodd M3IN ady - 6 GiNY
[ ! H . H
. . i . : : dIWYONTZONHS i
000'0ZeS ooo'covd ” Q8EEEEOCHN | 00 16BLC 2 8IES | (ALNWHHYAM) Junsan] om043uaH £cosn ZOO;, SHN|0EQZ/BE/S | © 0LOZ | NOSMOVT
103rodd M3N aav - g iy
| (ALNERVAR) | i i
0o0'0zes 000'00F$ QLESEE00HN | 00 LBLID EESIES (ALNYHHYAL) JHnSTY OHOLTAHAT T £508N zOOm m_._zm,o_‘o@.mw.@ o moSN NOSMIVT
123rodd AMEaN aay - ¢ diNY|
f . : . i {ALNVHEYA) i f
| 000'9ees | 000 1r4:2 GBEEEE0OHN | 0D /6220 € B1ES {ALNVEVAL SuNSTY | TIVHSHVIN-dINVONIZOHA EBOSTY; NOD SHN|0L0Z/82/9 | © |0r0z | mosxOvr
123rcodd MIN aay - ¢ QY
Zee'esb'es 000'008'6% _ QZZEGJOHNIY | 00 0024 B2 JLEX | ‘JAWd 40 'ND 'SNT9 om _,zmzwwn_“m_, o_._.wmm”__wwm_.ﬂm 601 ZOUM S__mo LOZ/8T/8 o OLOZ | NOSIYH
123r0dd M3N GaY - § TNV
| B 7 T T T * T
' : ! ; | loi
000'aol$ _ 000'6ELS QLLEGLZOHN |00 #LZL0 6LZ ELEN OIS SV 1SN WNOIS SNV 83 ver] &Z8N| NOOD n_l_.wm L LOE/REMR ] “ | L10Z | AN
. 103r0ud MIN Ady - & AAY
000'051% 000'DSLS a1610Z20dISH WS SEZLO 0ZZ ZLES 20N34 ALISVS TV _.mz_w xz_._mmn,ﬂu“_uﬁumwmm oZ2sn zoom dISH ﬁo LDE/BEIS U] oLog INHD
123rodd MdN gay - S ANy
| ; ! T ; i : i I
i - i - HIADIL) ¥ AN LYOHS; : W Deg © :
| gereas s | 0se L0Z'2% 001 1SV OLEN SINIWIACHAWI ALEdvs|  NOIOTY NwIHOVIvady:  O06WN zoo_ m_mwo_‘omamﬁ O DMz 3LAAVE
, QINIFIA NOLLYDOTTY DNIAYA 34 HIHA0 - | 1OV INIWETL IDONYHD - § AINY|
000'0Z5+$ . 00C'COB'LS | aD0SBOCALS | OO 98GR E0ES | (S0} e NVA-Azvo|  SE0AM zoow n_._.wmo_‘cm..mmﬁ j© iowoz | awoos
103r0dd M3N aay - § anY
_ , : . : , : i P ”
000'0¥2'L$ - DOU'0SS'LS | 0690SBDOALS | U0 ECEZ 98 £0ES . (G0} SHNSTY. ¥ LNV T-NYA mmo_;i NOO d1S,0102/82/9 | ©  :0M0Z |  3NOOA
. . SINIWWOS L23rodd
FONVHD . 1509 o wzawN : “, : i Coawa 5 m S
Bvand wos mkmm_w.wwmxn_ | 103708 | oA m HHOM 40 IdAL . IWYNIOIFOMJ | ILNOW | 3SYHE | IALONNS | NOLLIOI B0 | m | m | Addl, ALNROO

‘ 0102 HOd INIINANIWY NvEO0dd
GL02-040Z Add (d11S) WyHDOHd ININIAOHLNI NOILYLHOLSNYHL 3AIMIALYIS




¢ Joz afieg 0102/92/5  ®eg juud # ININONTNY
LOArodd M3N aay - § QY
! i B T T T I H H
N i i : S4NsId : i i P m
000°L2¥ 1% ” 000 £2¥' LS m QLerlondls | 0007200 74 FrES Ty - OM SONITIIS SHYvE PLOAM. zoom d415:0102/82/9 : L} ﬁ ,DEN _ INYOH
Z1YAIANYD ALHMOHLNY NOILYDIIFO ADaHd TYNOILLIJAY - 10370dHd M3IN 4ady - § QY
: | 000 ,“ ! ! _ 1
00c'9ge$ | 000'02YS Qro0/ZSuE | 00 JZL LOZG PYES | (@808 0/X0Z1dTd|  ME HOMY ATIAAINOD,  L0TSC0D NOD 4v0:010z/82/9 10 . 0M02 aNvod
JIYAIONYD ALRIOHLNY NOLLYDIT80 3D0iHE TYNQILLIAAY - LO3rodd MaN ady - § GAY
008'Z¥5$ 005'8.9% QIB90RZO0HA 00 84¥ BZ BEES (zexeen n_m_m_w §A N OTy4408 820AM NOD 4v¥0|010g/82/8 | 0LOZ | LNOHYDOd
£8'¥1-022-62ES /M G3ANTONI MHOM ‘NANYHAHLIM - S AINY|
. M w !
(09a'e9L %) 0% i 0% Q08L0ZZODHN | 0DELFL 022 62EN ONINDIS NZX ONINDIS NISATI czzsn; NOOD SHNI0L0Z/BZ/L | © L, ¢ loloz ToEANIA
123rCdd MAN aay - § QY
_ , m . _
m ' : ’ : _
| 000 5ZLS 000'szHS QLOCSECLdLS |00 CLO SOE0L $2EN STYNDIS ONIHEYIH LEN! ONISSOUD SNl S0/E0107 NOD mm_owow\mma 0LeZ | F1aMOaDIN
LI3Arodd MaN aay - & ANy
” Q00'Ge2s oQoo'szesd az0oe0i0dLsS | 00 282 €0k FEEN STLYS % SHIHSY T4 OL ¥OdN ONISSOUD SAHOHL 20LAM NOD Hy:0102/8¢/2 . 0Loe | TEMOaOW
103rodd MaN Gy - ¢ AiNY
H ‘ i |
000'522$ 000'GZZ$ | QLODEDIOALS (00 YOBOOEOM¥ZEN |  oo|ye g GuZHEYTS OL MEN] MOTION el eoiam|  NOD yul0102/82/9 | 0MOZ | TI3MOTON
123r0dEd AMAaN aay - § GV
-~ R— 33D OTv4Ng _, ”
| oco 00g% | 000 058 (912Z9:00HE | 00 8EVLD 91 €ZES y— 10 So0RE 151 Clicons zoo_ ¥g0 WoT/gelL @ maSN ﬁ NYSO3
A1YAIANYD ALIMOHLNY NOLLYD!Ig0 IDAIHEE 1¥NQILLIAAY - LO3r0dd MaIN ddy - 5 GAV
H ] H ] I H
. | . i i | |
000'08+% | 000 009% agzTL000H8 0OEPL LETES | (@998 5 X T aay WA HHOH LTS 10000 NOD u?_owo LOZ/BEZ/9 @ joL0e NYD0T
ISYIHONI 1SOD ‘0INIJIT NOILYDOTIV ONIAYL 034 HIHLO0 - ¢ rav{(Ga LYNINEE D) IZIHOHLNY-3d - § WGY
, - , — ,
: m‘ . : o vz |
0% 000'2§L$  ; 0:£Z)00DLSOY | DOECO00 b 2288 | L6'1) JHNSTY a8 WA dAW Ailele] NOJ diS|0L0Z/LLE @ :0L0Z | NIOONM
123r0Nd M3N adv - S dINY|
m C00'0ves 000°008% QOVEEEODdLS | D0 BELED EE VCES ” L6 D) AHNS Ty eI nmﬂm.%mmm‘_qﬁ nmow:m NOD, dis|0i0z/gzie o moSN , SIAE
123rodd mdnN ddy - g dY
: : i '0)67 ‘55T ' : : ! : o W
{ 000'0GL'6LES . 000'00S'ZLE:  Zzolsboil Q0 ZL b9 DZES | z%wmm.m_w n_wmmmzmwwﬂuvmﬁﬂmwmm u_.__%_u_.wwm_\m_wﬂwm__m poo I zoom 93.2102/82/9 w LZLOZ | vHAMENY
LOIrodd M3IN Aav - 5 ANV
: , ; : | ; ! o |
000'025'2% - 000'DOF'6S | {00000 ZEBIZ 0BEX | qyoy 98300V B A LSNOD SSID0M NHVd NIMSNOOD! NOJ. o€ FI0Z/BT0L 1T THOZ | VHMYNW
. SINIWNOD LIArQud
JONVHO | 1500 . W3awON “ m ' awa g m ,
v | sy USRI D ronamvis SHOM 40 3dAL 3NN (OFrONd ANON | IYHI | JdALNNE NN & A%t aNn0D

0102 HOd 1NINANINY NvHD0ud
GLOZ-0L0Z Add (dILS) WYHDOH INIWIAOMLNT NOLLYLHOdSNYY L 3QIMILYLS




¢ 10 ¢ afeyq

0lLoZ/ee/s

:8jeq id

# LINIINONINY

123rodd Man dadv - & ANy

; bt i
000'02ES 00000V | QMPODLCZOWAD | 00100 Juid BESL zoﬁmzmwmmwﬂ“_n_\pwﬂ_m%&wwm zowm:ﬁﬂmwﬂwwﬁwﬂw OCOVN NOD DYWOD(0L0Z/8T/9 " ¢ lolog mmo_EH.ﬁm
S1d ¥3d ISYIHONI LSOO HIGNNN Ivd3a3d 31vddn - L rady ‘3SYIHINI LS00 TWH3A3d %Ie B UvaA VIS Tvdad3d JASIAGYE - ¢ QY
0 ]
008'1L00'1$ Dog2'18Y'ss 008'6E6'68 | QoZIvIOOLSOV | 00ipZ ¥l PSEN SN ¥ 0L HOdN A STIAM TYHINIA § ZLOAM NOD diS|0102/82/L W € WoSm a00M
133roddd ManN aav - § Ay
: i ATIAALIS _ o : !
oca'oges | 000'007$ G9ELPi00diS | 00B9Y ¥l pSEN INTWSSISSY MIANTD & 1M WWAINIA VLOAM, ONI d18|0102/82/9 w 0L0Z | aoom
L03AroHd AMEN aav - § aiNY
T . i ! i :
000'0898 | 000'0SR$ _ | 00 04720 OF BFEN Emm%.”_wm_ﬁm_\vmmon_a_ﬂ_. LSS VHAMYNYS H _.:oww OZOAM NOD diSH|[102/821% | © W:ow . WnHsdn
L123r0dd MIN aay - ¢ QY|
. _ “ [ SLINIWIADHAWI ! W m
000'08% 000’004 % m } 000220 0Z B¥EN PRHOLS "NT 17 OOV LTTHLS YHAYNYY HLAOS OZOAM| MOY dISH|0402/8¢/0L | © HL0Z L unHSdn
103rcdd M3anN aav - ¢ Qv
: . i 1138 , : : | o f
000'0¥% 00o'0se i 01001088 20 ZE400 20} SPES avis :u<ommw@_w.__< n_m_mw HE QVEHHIAO SIAY| L0V ZOO“ mmmowom\w@ﬁ “ o ﬁ Wo_.ow | SHIWANS
123r0de MAN Ay - & JNY
ooo'zé | ooo'szs | : ININTILLIS) W . ongl ug0L0Z/8Ze |© ooz |
! | 09L0/0L0MB |20 EELCD L0} SPES | Y18 HOVOHAY HIvdTd| A QVIHMIAO SiAv.  LOWAMA m W o | sdWANS
. SINIWNGD LOIrodd
JONVHD 1500  WmEAON : ! ava % w P
| i i ! i ! D e :
S5, wmoo wsoozs LYo N owowa  swoorow | aor awe | sewons CWSIP BB e o
: ; W ; oo, :

0102 HO4 LINIAONIINY WYHO0Hd

G10Z-0L0Z Add (dILS) WvHDHOHd INFWIAOY NI NOILYLYOdSNYHL JAIMILYLES




From:#VACO 304 346 0592 05/28/2010 16213 #104 P.002/002

Are CO(JN‘T‘{ Qmm/SS"/aMS“

Aericee OF  INTEREST
FRom . wVACo

:-;5"‘ Staif wnte:

Sta:e m's.m‘an : éonums—
“swnerlaneChne defendeda.— -8
recent change.in the way. hased-on

_ " workers’. comp nsaﬁon pre— ..She;said these
“mitims- forvol -fire de- 7~ 'uresa i
parunepis wﬂl be_calculated; .~ buit fréquently

. ‘saying-that, w1thout the . sz




BMO3[GLEY

Juieg
1uHung

SULLIB ] A0 "{R2OO7] JO
NG papiny Jjoq 9244 Y

Py ARpE Aszeh

wdg e ylel aunf Aepanjeg

-
it
Ed

=

®

1 spieyyng

a[paskauteay

HMOLSUUIHAAHS
0i

w (o)



AMUNMOL STTAVHD INYT NOGYEIY NIHSOO 8LL

1 UOCEILN U
(30 LAY

‘saunjsnd ysn) pup sppey dos oBp anig eyl

10 ma pianipuBows sy Aclus pup wing 8 Ino) uoyadsul
osop dn o) Anjdsip uo aq im ejey Alpp pup Bid “quiny)
spaiold yoojseny H-p suig woaf pun sBuIppNg |DUOHIPRD ST
{8 SD poSISLLLR aL| 8306 wing AInjUsd gl D pub ssnoy
[DAIAEY 38810 £F9L BL|L (ADY puD 8|03} DEoHD Subagios
‘L102) SdoSD YSD3 puD SO ADP UL 10| PO SBSIDI LD}
aluoy ay] “UcHDIadD AIDE BUY I} YA U 1YBN0og SDM ULD)
[DUOIIPPE UD ‘UL 80UIS 9861 Ui AN "AJUND) tosisysy o}
AW AILN0D AIBLIoB{UOR LUDL] palbIo|al SSIUS 241 €961

ug pasoysind som AR U
LD BUWI0L a1 {yA
AN SBES Ond) U S2100
00#F1 [SOWD Wy “Aor
1BBNDR pUR BABIS LI0S
IS DINGIDG puUD ARG

R

AMCINIO TS “Od JOLdALS 281

LIS 5 FLI

Ao |

‘Buyuied 820} pun sep Auod aad) soyd Wiy

ay Aojue oy Ajuny auy Buug -esudisius ayy joddns pusiD
J0OPINO PajYBy pup sHH0pp0d Wing AZod y "sejus Big snd
LNJ 40 5101 S} HNS2I BY) pub ApusLy pey 8q oy sajuod 18y suibl
31ZNG "S1aLla Bl| UiA U0 IDIBIME 80w pub sepy Auod 1o
LD 9Y; 0} BLIO3 O P SMO[ID SBIDPRAD)Y AUOd "$BpU Auod
SPIADLC PUD [LUIBAS IN0A O] SO fitA S2pl AUCH S58IAX AU
“SIUOAB PUD SpY| Jof sapu Auod
SIAJ0 pUD Sa510Y Bunpsy Sy Yim
sappdwiod 8zng sasicy Buppoy
pUD S8SI0Y SINDILIL ‘SABYUOP Ag
paindod s] Winy L8 sedys pun
SO7IS ||D JO S8510Y $9AC] SULiig B1ZNg

LAMRPAE Y

! Sapp AUO L SRaddy Alg] D) ALY

L2 4 24ang @

B0 9510y 0 BPIS LLID]
3} 998 puUD SWIDY sy} INo ‘suiBlS gsin Buznib s|no)
[PUD SSUBLL L1044 "jrng Buiag) s wipg Ably 0 pud S58UI504
auy o apIs BLIpa9Iq 8sioy Ly 8iafdiiod wng UoYDIs D
PUD LG BUno) ¥ 'SD0J g SBIDWI 10} BUG PUD $PI0 I08A

7 404 BUO UDSIDIBXS BSIOY UM SLIDG 350U ||0)S £7 0M
210 8I8L{] "S2U00 Of [SCWD Jeac poauds 2ip 81oul pun
spoppod uad punoct a0 Butundl oflul §/£ D 'SUING oY
‘ofin sipah om sn] AjunoD uoslagsr of sBply nbag paaowl
uyor pum ApuiD “Ansnpul
Buzps paigubnoioLy 030
B Uy AjlaDBY POISOAL pUD
a3l siyy Buipp) asioy spput
SO S8RW LUYOT 4961 Ul
asdsl $ Jauml o Buuinigo

LY PNISUOZLIOY LD M
AN ITHSASNEY T INYT RV 6881

AdJLIn”

"SDIANID ) B} 10 PUD SBBL SDLUSLILY supdund
aonposd Jop wirss of unid pub spiay pajunid al 9os puo
apy ADY D U OO "BPS 40) SqNIYS pup seedl ‘sjucid Buippag
BUI INC 303D B3OV ULID4 PUD 83ND0Id UMD 1104 3id b
ek S0 pup oD ay) uc uloddod 2injpubls ‘007 Builed
'SP ADH BZ0W L0 LPING upiduing b Supaidul SBHALDD
IPLOSDBS PapPD ABY| SIDBA 8| 1BAG "DBYSIGDISE SDM DBID
Alasinu papundx® pPUD LLDE 831} SOWISHYD D Y00 PUNCH
IV 'PDOJ SL} SSOLD S3I0
0oL Jo esoudind auy L
papundxs ASY} 6661 Y
161 U Aasinn Auno))
"B UMO] DPBUSHAD|SE
qqo), Asupn pun gog

P T T A
107y G

ey PUNoH




NOTICE OF PUBLIC OUTREACH EDUCATION WORKSHOP
COUNTY COMMISSION OF JEFFERSON COUNTY
SUBDIVISION REGULATION AMENDMENTS

The County Commission of Jefferson County will hold a Public Qutreach
Education Workshop to give staff an opportunity to brief the County
Commission and the public regarding the proposed text amendments to the
Subdivision Regulations. The workshop will be held on Thursday, June 24,
2010, at 6:00 p.m. in the Old Charles Town Library Meeting Room on the
ground floor of the Library, 200 East Washington Street, Charles Town, WV
25414,

No public input will be received at this workshop. A follow up public
hearing for the purpose of receiving public comment will be scheduled at a
later date.

By Order of The County
Commission of Jefferson County
Lyn Widmyer, President




